
September 23, 2008

Intuit Eliminates Separate Federal E-file
Fees for TurboTax Software
SAN DIEGO--(BUSINESS WIRE)--

Intuit Inc. (Nasdaq:INTU) today announced that it has eliminated the separate charge for
federal electronic filing in its TurboTax(R) packaged software products, the nation's leading
tax preparation software. This decision more closely aligns the federal TurboTax desktop
pricing structure with TurboTax Online where e-file is included with purchase.

"Eliminating separate fees for filing individual federal tax returns is the right thing for
American taxpayers," said Kiran Patel, senior vice president and general manager of Intuit's
Consumer Tax Division. "This will encourage more e-filed returns and help the IRS achieve
its e-file goals."

Senator Charles Schumer (D-NY), Chairman of the Joint Economic Committee, Member of
the Senate Finance Committee, and the leading advocate in Congress for universal free e-
filing, recognized Intuit's decision.

"I am pleased to see that Intuit is taking a leadership role by eliminating all separate federal
e-filing fees in its leading TurboTax products, as communicated in their letter to me of
September 12, 2008. It is my hope that by next tax season all of the major tax software and
tax preparation companies will follow suit and that e-filing will be free for all taxpayers,
regardless of how they file their returns."

Consumer adoption of e-filing has grown dramatically, and the majority of TurboTax
customers now file their tax returns electronically. By including services such as
ItsDeductible, Audit Support and now federal e-filing, TurboTax delivers greater ease and
value to taxpayers. Rather than charge separately for these various services, Intuit now
includes them in TurboTax at a price lower than what customers would have otherwise paid
for them separately.

About Intuit Inc.

Intuit Inc. is a leading provider of business and financial management solutions for small and
mid-sized businesses; financial institutions, including banks and credit unions; consumers
and accounting professionals. Its flagship products and services, including QuickBooks(R),
Quicken(R) and TurboTax(R) software, simplify small business management and payroll
processing, personal finance, and tax preparation and filing. ProSeries(R) and Lacerte(R)
are Intuit's leading tax preparation software suites for professional accountants. The
company's financial institutions division, anchored by Digital Insight, provides on-demand
banking services to help banks and credit unions serve businesses and consumers with
innovative solutions.

Founded in 1983, Intuit had annual revenue of $3.1 billion in its fiscal year 2008. The



company has approximately 8,000 employees with major offices in the United States,
Canada, the United Kingdom and other locations. More information can be found at
www.intuit.com.
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