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Got Tax Questions? TurboTax Has
Answers.
Get Answers to Tax Questions for Free

SAN DIEGO--(BUSINESS WIRE)--

Beginning today, taxpayers can get a free answer to a personal federal tax question at
www.FreeTaxQuestion.com. Those who submit a question online will receive a personal call
back, at a time they request, from a tax expert from TurboTax (R), the nation's leading tax
software.

Although the filing deadline is months away, many people have burning tax questions long
before they sit down to prepare their returns. Many wonder how life's big changes, such as
getting married, buying a home or having a baby, will affect their taxes. Others may want to
know how recent tax law changes related to the Alternative Minimum Tax may impact them.
No matter what the question, TurboTax makes it easier than ever to get accurate and
actionable answers right away.

"TurboTax easily handles all these tax situations and more," said Bob Meighan, a certified
public accountant and vice president with TurboTax. "We know that getting an answer to that
one burning question before you start your taxes can help people feel even more confident.
TurboTax makes it easy to get answers every step of the way."

No purchase is necessary to participate. The offer ends on Jan. 31 and is subject to
availability. Further information is available at www.FreeTaxQuestion.com.

About Intuit Inc.

Intuit Inc. is a leading provider of business and financial management solutions for small and
mid-sized businesses; financial institutions, including banks and credit unions; consumers
and accounting professionals. Its flagship products and services, including QuickBooks(R),
Quicken(R) and TurboTax(R) software, simplify small business management and payroll
processing, personal finance, and tax preparation and filing. ProSeries(R) and Lacerte(R)
are Intuit's leading tax preparation software suites for professional accountants. The
company's financial institutions division, anchored by Digital Insight, provides on-demand
banking services to help banks and credit unions serve businesses and consumers with
innovative solutions.

Founded in 1983, Intuit had annual revenue of $2.67 billion in its fiscal year 2007. The
company has approximately 8,000 employees with major offices in the United States,
Canada, the United Kingdom and other locations. More information can be found at
www.intuit.com.
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registered service marks of Intuit Inc. in the United States and other countries.
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